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Andy Choptiany Takes WBC War At Sea Crown 
Jonathan Lockwood Inducted Into WAS Hall of Fame 

Is Your Game Missing Its Axis Counters? 
 

Andy Choptiany of Philadelphia, PA won the 2013 War At Sea Championship on Thursday, August 1 
with a record of 6-1-1.  Andy was playing in only his fourth full tournament, but he had made the playoffs in 2 
of his previous attempts and qualified for them last year but had to decline due to a family emergency.  Andy 
defeated Bruce Monnin of Minster, OH (5-3-0) in the final.  Ben Gardner of Fairfax, VA, finished 3rd with a 
6-1-0 tally; Ben was the only player to win every game in the Swiss rounds.  Joe Powell of Manassas, VA took 
4th place honors with a 4-2-0 mark and Vernon Hills, IL’s Rob Drozd captured the 5th and final plaque with a 4-
2-0 log.  David Rynkowski (Troy, NY/3-2-0) finished 5th and received a copy of the coffee table book 
Mussolini’s Navy, given to the highest finisher not winning a plaque.  The remaining playoff participants were 
7th, Jonathan Lockwood (Reston, VA), who had a 3-3-0 mark, and 8th, Bruce Reiff (Lewis Center, OH), also 
with a 3-3-0 finish.  Completing our top 10 were John Pack (Parker, CO) in 9th place at 3-2-0, and Charlie 
Drozd (Vernon Hills, IL), 10th place with a 3-2-0 mark. 
 
 In a brief ceremony prior to the start of the tournament, Jonathan Lockwood became the 5th member of 
the War At Sea Hall of Fame, joining previous inductees Alan Applebaum, Ray Freeman, Andy Gardner, 
and Bruce Monnin.  Jonathan’s list of achievements, including winning 2 WBCs, 2 BPA PBEM 
Championships, and more tournament games than any other player, is so long that it nearly caused the GM to 
run out of breath while reading the inscription on his plaque.  A second inductee was unable to attend and will 
be honored at the 2014 tourney.  Despite the bulls-eye on his back, Jonathan managed a 6th straight playoff nod, 
a record. 
 
 I picked up a complete set of Axis counters in a plastic bag from the Lampeter floor at the end of the 
long tournament day — please check your game to see if yours is missing! 
 
 30 players opened the competition shortly after 9 AM on tournament day, and another 9 entered in later  
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2013 Tournament Recap (continued) 
 
rounds.  As is customary, eligibility for the majority of the playoff spots came down to Round 5, 8 hours later.  
Customarily, a large number of players is playoff-eligible at the beginning of Round 5.  This year, however, due 
to a high number of close games resulting in 8- and 2-POC scores, there were only 12 players competing for the 
8 playoff berths.  Ben Gardner (4-0-0, 38 VPs to that point) and David Rynkowski (3-1-0, 36 VPs) were the 
leaders and played the top board.  David was seeking his first playoff appearance.  Ben’s Allies, bidding 1.5, 
defeated Dave’s Axis, but both made the playoffs.  On the 2nd board, defending champ Jonathan Lockwood (3-
1-0, 32 VPs) squared off against Rob Drozd (3-1-0, 30 VPs).  Rob’s Axis maxed out against Jonathan’s Allies, 
not even needing the 2.5 bid to help the margin of victory, but again, both players made the playoffs.  Next, 
current PBEM Ladder Champ John Pack (3-1-0, 28 VPs) faced another player seeking his first single-
elimination appearance, Joe Powell (3-1-0 and 28 VPs).  In one of the day’s closest games, it was Joe’s Axis 
denying John (Allies, 1.5 bid) a playoff spot by the exact margin of the bid.  The 4th board featured Ray 
Freeman (3-1-0/28 VPs) vs. Andy Choptiany (2-1-1/27 VPs); Andy’s victory as the Allies, bidding 2.0, 
clinched his playoff slot and denied Ray one.  John Elliott (2-1-1/23 VPs and Bruce Monnin (2-2-0, 22 VPs) 
played for the 7th playoff position, and Bruce’s Allies, bidding 2.0 sent John to the sidelines.  Finally, Bruce 
Reiff (2-2-0, 22 VPs) and the GM (2-2-0, 22 VPs) competed for the final single-elimination seat.  Bruce’s Axis 
won going away against the GM’s Allies, who bid 2.0.  
 

At the conclusion of the Swiss round games, the 8 playoff qualifiers were set, with, unusually, no 
tiebreaker needed: 1) Ben Gardner, 48 Victory Points/5-0-0, 2) Rob Drozd, 40 VPs, 4-1-0, 3) Andy 
Choptiany, 37 VPs & 3-1-1, 4) David Rynkowski, 36 VPs/3-1-0, 5) Joe Powell, 36 VPs, 4-1-0, 6) Jonathan 
Lockwood, 32 VPs & 3-2-0, 7) Bruce Monnin (32 VPs/3-2-0) and 8) Bruce Reiff, also 32 VPs & 3-2-0.  As 
mentioned, Jonathan was in the playoffs for the 6th straight year (and 8th year overall).   Bruce Monnin made 
the playoffs for the 3rd year in a row, and Ben Gardner for the 2nd  year in a row.  Joe Powell and David 
Rynkowski were making the initial playoff sorties. 
 

In the quarterfinals, top seed Ben Gardner’s Allies handled #8 seed Bruce Reiff’s Axis, #3 Andy 
Choptiany’s Axis blew out #6 Jonathan Lockwood’s Allies, #7 Bruce Monnin’s Allies outlasted #2 Rob 
Drozd’s Axis, and #4 Joe Powell’s Allies maxed out against #5 David Rynkowski’s Axis.  The semifinals 
were rearranged slightly to avoid a rematch; Andy Choptiany’s Axis used the 2.5 bid they received to edge 
Ben Gardner’s Allies by a razor-thin 0.5 POC margin; Bruce Monnin’s Allies, bidding 1.5, killed lots of 
Germans in a big turn 2 battle and used the resulting momentum to defeat Joe Powell’s Axis. 
 
 The final game rematched Andy Choptiany and Bruce Monnin; Andy’s Allies had already bested 
Bruce’s Axis in Swiss Round 3. This time, Bruce took the Allies for 2.5.  It was Andy’s first final and Bruce’s 
5th, but while Bruce had more playoff experience, Andy was no novice.  He has qualified for the playoffs each 
of the 4 times he has played a full tourney, and entered this year’s event as the #2 seed.   Andy took the early 
lead, winning a North Atlantic battle on turn 1 to gain 2 POC at a cost of 2 ships while sinking 3 British 
battleships.  POC remained the same for the next few turns; Allied LBA could not hit Italian cruisers while Axis 
LBA managed to sink an Allied ship every turn.  Ineffective Allied ASW allowed the U-boat fleet to remain 
largely intact and sink another one or 2 Allied ships per turn.  However, Bruce fought back to bring the game 
down to the last turn.  Bruce’s Allies had convoys in both the North Atlantic and Barents, needing to land both 
for the win.  Bruce’s 10 ASW in the North Atlantic removed all 4 remaining U-boats and he was able to put that 
convoy into England for a single POC.  The game thus came down to the last die roll against the Barents 
convoy; the Axis needed to sink or disable the convoy to preserve their 2.5 POC margin.  The big roll was a 5, 
disabling the last convoy back to the USA and handing the win to Andy’s Axis.  For the second year in a row,  
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2013 Tournament Recap (continued) 
 
the championship came down to the last die roll of the game.  Congratulations again to 2013 champion Andy 
Choptiany! 
 

Air conditioning was perfect in the Lampeter Room this year, but entrants (39) and games played (72) 
declined from last year, when they were the highest in 5 years, notwithstanding the tropical rainforest conditions 
in our venue.  Go figure!  After 9 years in which no chess clock expired, one (and only one) flag did drop this 
year, but it did not impact the game’s outcome.  Andy Choptiany added to his winnings by claiming Best Axis 
Player honors at 3-0-0, topping Joe Powell and David Rynkowski, who tallied 3-2-0 each.  Ben Gardner’s 5-
1-0 ledger earned him Best Allied Player, just ahead of Rob Drozd at 3-0-0 and Bruce Monnin at 5-2-0.  Is the 
torch being passed?  Ben’s dad Andy has 4 Best Allied Player awards.  Rob Drozd is our sportsmanship 
nominee.  Facing an inexperienced player, Rob chose to use the game as a teaching experience, not worrying 
about his own playoff chances.  It was not the first time Rob has done so. 

 
There will be one format change next year; the victory points for a bye will only be awarded if a player 

is on hand at the start of a round.  Also, I would like to see us conduct a demo, so we can make War At Sea an 
A level event and recruit some new players.  Unfortunately I do not have time to do it myself.  If this interests 
you, please let me know.  I look forward to seeing you all next year! 

 
Strategy, Play Balance, and Bidding 
 Our competitors did not change their collective Allied strategy much this year.  The overwhelmingly 
favored opening was Barents on 1; a few games featured the Mediterranean strategy.  I do not have precise 
statistics, but Axis players seem to be increasingly disinclined to fight early in the game. 
 
 After last year’s nearly perfect play balance, Axis players apparently rested on their laurels this year.  
The Allies won 41 contests (56.9%) to the Axis 30 (41.7%), and there was one tie.  56 of the 72 games featured 
an Allied bid; 16 had no bid and no player bid for the Axis.  The 16 games with no bid represented a 
considerable increase from last year’s 4.  The average bid this year was 1.38 (all games) and 1.77 (games with a 
bid).  Both averages were lower than last year’s all-time highs.  Here is a breakdown of wins and losses by bid. 
 
Bid Games Axis Win Allied Win Tie Allied Win % 
No Bid/Allied Bid 0 16 5 11 0 68.8% 
Allies 1.0 7 3 4 0 57.1% 
Allies 1.5 20 8 12 0 60.0% 
Allies 2.0 21 9 11 1 54.8% 
Allies 2.5 8 5 3 0 37.5% 
Totals 72 30 41 1 57.6% 
 
 Note that the Allied winning percentage was highest (almost 69%) in games with no bid, and lowest in 
the games with the highest bid, 2.5 (below 38%).  When employed, bids obviously do their job.  Note also that 
the Allies won a majority of games at any bid below 2.5. 
 
 Bidding influenced the outcome directly in 13 games.  One Allied win became a tie, 3 ties became Axis 
wins, and 4 Allied wins became Axis wins after the bid was taken into account.  On top of those numbers, 4 
Allied wins by 2 POC or more became Allies victories by less than 2 POC, and one Axis win by less than 2 
POC converted to an Axis win by 2 POC or more. 
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2013 World Boardgaming Championships Final Standings 
 
     Axis Allies Total Swiss Schedule 
No. Name Played W-L-T W-L-T W-L-T Points  Strength Finish 
 
 2 Andy Choptiany 8 3-0-0 3-1-1 6-1-1 37 — 1 
 9 Bruce Monnin 8 0-1-0 5-2-0 5-3-0 32 5.00 2 
 20 Ben Gardner 7 1-0-0 5-1-0 6-1-0 48 — 3 
 29 Joe Powell 7 3-2-0 2-0-0 5-2-0 36 5.10 4 
 7 Rob Drozd 6 1-2-0 3-0-0 4-2-0 40 — 5 
 28 David Rynkowski 5 3-2-0 — 3-2-0 *36 7.25 6 
 1 Jonathan Lockwood 6 — 3-3-0 3-3-0 32 6.29 7 
 14 Bruce Reiff 6 3-3-0 — 3-3-0 32 4.57 8 
 8 John Pack 5 — 3-2-0 3-2-0 30 5.88 9 
 3 Charlie Drozd 5 1-2-0 2-0-0 3-2-0 30 4.46 10 
 
 12 Ray Freeman 5 1-1-0 2-1-0 3-2-0 28 5.63 11 
 5 Jim Kramer 5 0-1-0 3-1-0 3-2-0 28 4.48 12 
 16 John Elliott 5 1-2-1 1-0-0 2-2-1 23 4.22 13 
 27 Bob Hamel 5 2-3-0 — 2-3-0 22 H to H 14 
 11 Vince Meconi 5 1-0-0 1-3-0 2-3-0 22 H to H 15 
 25 Alan Zasada 5 1-2-0 1-1-0 2-3-0 20 4.08 16 
 26 Greg Hultgren 3 1-1-0 0-1-0 1-2-0 *20 2.92 17 
 35 Pat Richardson 2 1-0-0 1-0-0 2-0-0 20 1.40 18 
 19 John Sharp 5 0-4-0 1-0-0 1-4-0 14 — 19 
 22 Sean Druelinger 2 1-1-0 — 1-1-0 10 6.67 20 
 
 34 Ed Menzel 1 1-0-0 — 1-0-0 10 6.00 21 
 10 Joe Collinson 3 1-1-0 0-1-0 1-2-0 10 6.00 22 
 4 Steve Packwood 3 0-1-0 1-1-0 1-2-0 10 4.67 23 
 31 Randy Schilb 3 1-2-0 — 1-2-0 10 4.22 24 
 32 Daniel Blumentritt 1 — 1-0-0 1-0-0 10 1.60 25 
 37 Glenn McMaster 1 1-0-0 — 1-0-0 10 0.00 26 
 38 Mike Kaye 1 — 1-0-0 1-0-0 10 0.00 27 
 17 Tim Hitchings 1 — 1-0-0 1-0-0 10 0.00 28 
 36 Ed O’Connor 1 1-0-0 — 1-0-0 10 0.00 29 
 33 Bruno Sinigaglio 1 1-0-0 — 1-0-0 10 0.00 30 
 
 15 Chuck Stapp 4 0-1-0 1-2-0 1-3-0 8 — 31 
 30 John Welage 3 0-2-0 0-1-0 0-3-0 2 — 32 
 18 Greg Smith 2 0-1-0 0-1-0 0-2-0 0 10.00 33 
 39 John Vogel 1 0-1-0 — 0-1-0 0 10.00 34 
 23 Michel Boucher 1 0-1-0 — 0-1-0 0 8.00 35 
 24 Rob Hammond 3 0-1-0 0-2-0 0-3-0 0 5.64 36 
 13 Scott Beall 3 — 0-3-0 0-3-0 0 5.23 37 
 6 Andy Gardner 1 — 0-1-0 0-1-0 0 5.00 38 
 21 Glenn Petroski 5 0-3-0 0-2-0 0-5-0 0 4.88 39 
 39 Totals 144 30-41-1 41-30-1 71-71-2 **670 
 
Key 
* Includes 10 points awarded for a bye. 
No. — Player seeding. 
Played — Number of games played by player, including quarterfinals, semifinals, and final. 
W-L-T — Won-Lost-Tied 
Swiss Points — Number of VPs scored in 5 preliminary (Swiss) rounds. 
Schedule Strength — Used to break ties among players with same VPs; equals # of VPs earned by player’s opponents  
   divided by # of games played by player’s opponents. 
H to H — Ranking after preliminary rounds determined by head-to-head results rather than schedule strength. 
Finish — Final ranking.  Top 8 players are ranked by results of playoffs. 
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War At Sea AREA Ratings/Preliminary 2014 WBC Seedings (as of August 19, 2013) 

 
 1 Andy Choptiany (Defending Champion) 6486 21 Mike Knautz 5702 
 2 Pat Richardson 6257 22 Ray Freeman 5671 
 3 Jonathan Lockwood 6204 23 Mike Ussery 5645 
 4 Glenn McMaster 6047 24 Avi Solomon 5634 
 5 Charlie Drozd 6042 25 Alan Applebaum 5621 
 6T Mike Kaye 5952 26 Ewan McNay 5568 
 6T Tim Tow 5952 27 Ted Drozd 5557 
 8T Darren Kilfara 5942 28 Vince Meconi 5551 
 8T Ed Menzel 5942 29 Bruce Reiff 5550 
 10 Andy Gardner 5930 30 Phil Watkins 5536 
 11 Bruce Monnin 5923 31 Joe Collinson 5533 
 12 Jim Kramer 5906 32 Ron Dietz 5532-i 
 13 Mike Pacheco 5855 33 John Strand 5515 
 14 John Pack 5853 34 Nick Markevich 5493 
 15 Steve Packwood  5801 35 Kevin Shewfelt 5491 
 16 Rob Drozd 5794 36 Jim Laws 5474 
 17 Rob Flowers 5787-i 37 David Lindsay 5471 
 18 Ben Gardner 5772 38 David Finberg 5440-i 
 19 Don Greenwood 5759 39 Steve Carver 5434-i  
 20 Dennis Nicholson 5747 40 Phil Rennert 5425 
 
i=Inactive AREA status. 
Italicized players have not previously entered a WBC/Avaloncon War At Sea tournament. 
 
Many Thanks 
 As always, putting on the War At Sea tournament is a team effort, starting with Assistant Gamemasters 
Rob Drozd and John Sharp.  Charlie Drozd not only provided the chess clocks, he personally set up most of 
them.  My opponents, Bob Hamel, Rob Hammond, Greg Hultgren, Joe Powell, and Bruce Reiff, played 
quickly and set up the game afterwards, allowing me to attend to my GM duties.  Finally, thanks to Greg 
Smith, Ed Menzel, and Greg Hultgren, who each volunteered, in turn, to be the “odd man out” if we had an 
odd number of players — only Greg H. got stuck with a bye. 
 
War At Sea E-Mail Tournaments 
 BPA PBEM Championship X recently kicked off under the direction of War At Sea Hall of Famer 
Bruce Monnin.  This event’s Swiss-Elimination format means that you can join the tourney for any or all later 
rounds even if you didn’t play in Round 1.  Follow the action at 
http://www.nktelco.net/bdmonnin/bpa_was_pbem.htm.  Meanwhile, the War At Sea Ladder Tournament will 
begin Round 49 at the end of this month.  This highly competitive event has seen 9 different champions in the 
last 11 rounds (John Pack and Bryan Brinkman being the only 2 individuals to be on top twice).  Tim Tow is 
in charge, and complete details on the tourney can be found at http://waratsea.wordpress.com/round-48/. 
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Tournament Notes and Statistics 
 Tim Hitchings remains the only player to have played at least one game in every one of the 23 War At 
Sea tournament at Avaloncon and the WBC….Other current consecutive tournament appearance streaks of 11 
years or more are Jonathan Lockwood and Steve Packwood, 19 years since 1995, Andy Gardner and Jim 
Kramer, 17 years since 1997, Ed Menzel, 14 years since 2000, Ray Freeman, the GM, David Rynkowski, 
and John Welage, 12 consecutive years since 2002, and Charlie Drozd, Rob Drozd, John Sharp, and Chuck 
Stapp (11 straight years since 2003)…. By winning the Victory in the Pacific event earlier in the week, John 
Sharp became only the 3rd player to win the championships of both our sister game and War At Sea at the 
WBC.  He was eager to try to become the first player ever to win both in the same year, but he dropped his first 
two contests by less than 2 POC, and it didn’t get much better the rest of the way…Bob Hamel, Bruce Reiff, 
and David Rynkowski played every game as the Axis, while Jonathan Lockwood and John Pack flew Allied 
colors each time out ….100% of our first time-competitors, that is, both Michel Boucher and Rob Hammond, 
visited us from Ontario, Canada, which meant that our Canadian contingent was 3-strong, an all-time high…. 
Welcome back returnees Daniel Blumentritt, Glenn McMaster, Glenn Petroski, Pat Richardson, Bruno 
Sinigaglio, John Vogel, and Alan Zasada…Most of our returnees rejoined us after only a year or two absence, 
but John and Alan have been otherwise occupied since 2001….Participation in the annual Family War At Sea 
event has dwindled to just two contestants, with the Gardners, son Ben and dad Andy, besting the father-son 
Drozd tandem of Rob and Charlie….John Elliott could lay claim to the day’s toughest schedule after playing 
seed numbers 1, 2, 5, and 9, but so could Ben Gardner, who faced seeds 1, 4, 5, and 7….In addition to champ 
Andy Choptiany, personal best finishes were recorded by Ben Gardner (2), Joe Powell (4), David 
Rynkowski (6), Alan Zasada (16), Greg Hultgren (17), Randy Schilb (24), and John Vogel (34)….Rob 
Hammond contributed my favorite quote for this year: “My dice were so bad I’d have been better off ramming 
my opponents’ ships”….Greg Hultgren was close behind with “I’m playing this event so I’ll stay humble.” 
 
 John Pack is displaying impressive balance in his War At Sea competitions, having played exactly 81 
games as the Axis and 81 as the Allies, plus 81 face-to-face games and 81 by e-mail….23 years of War At Sea 
tournaments have included 8 Avaloncons, 15 WBCs, 47 PBEM Ladder Rounds, and 9 BPA PBEM 
Championships....Of the 3,308 games played so far, the Allies have won 1,674 (51.5%) to the Axis’ 1,497 
(46.1%), with 77 ties (2.4%) and 60 in which either no side was chosen or we are missing the information.... 
There have been 1,907 contests with an Allied bid (61.1%) and 157 featuring Axis bids (5.0%); there was no 
bid in 1,056 games (33.8%) and we lack details for 205 games....However, every tournament contested in the 
last 7 years has had at least 75% bids for the Allies….The 5 best career tournament War At Sea winning 
percentages belong to 1-tie) David Finberg and Avi Solomon (.714), 3) Tom Scarborough (.692), 4) Pat 
Richardson (.681), and 5) Glenn McMaster (.676)....The 5 top Axis records are held by 1) David Finberg 
(.818), 2-tie) Tim Tow and Phil Watkins (.750), 4) Glenn McMaster (.728), and 5) Jonathan Lockwood 
(.695)....John Elliott (.769) tops the Allied charts, followed by 2) Mircea Pauca (.733), 3) Phil Rennert 
(.725), 4) Bruce Reiff (.721), and 5) Don Greenwood (.714)....Ewan McNay and Glenn McMaster have the 
best record in WBC/Avaloncon games at .735, Scott Beall the best PBEM Ladder winning percentage at .846, 
and Jonathan Lockwood the top balance sheet in BPA PBEM Championship contests (.756)....Jonathan 
Lockwood and Bruce Monnin share most of the “Mosts”: Jonathan has played the most tournament games, 
205, and has the most total wins (137), Allied wins (109), and playoff appearances (9); Bruce has the most Axis 
wins (61) and WBC/Avaloncon wins (73). 
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2013 World Boardgaming Championships Final Game-by-Game Results 
 
No. Name Round 1 Round 2 Round 3 Round 4 Round 5 VPs 
 
 Players: 30 Players: 30 Players: 25 Players: 25 Players: 22 
 Games: 15 Games: 15 Games: 12 Games: 12 Games: 11 
 
 1 Jonathan Lockwood W-10 v. 15 W-10 v. 14 L-2 v. 20 W-10 v. 16 L-0 v. 7 32 
 2 Andy Choptiany T-5 v. 16 W-10 v. 3 W-10 v. 9 L-2 v. 28 W-10 v.12 37 
 3 Charlie Drozd W-8 v. 19 L-0 v. 2 W-10 v. 15 L-2 v. 12 W-10 v. 25 30 
 4 Steve Packwood L-0 v. 20 W-10 v. 21  L-0 v. 27  10 
 5 Jim Kramer W-10 v. 21 L-0 v. 20 L-0 v. 16 W-10 v. 31 W-8 v. 27 28 
 6 Andy Gardner L-0 v. 22     0 
 7 Rob Drozd W-10 v. 23 W-10 v. 22 W-10 v. 29 L-0 v. 20 W-10 v. 1 40 
 8 John Pack W-10 v. 24 W-10 v. 27 L-0 v. 34 W-8 v. 14 L-2 v. 29 30 
 9 Bruce Monnin W-10 v. 25 L-2 v. 28 L-0 v. 2 W-10 v. 19 W-10 v. 16 32 
 10 Joe Collinson W-10 v. 26 L-0 v. 29 L-0 v. 14   10 
 
 11 Vince Meconi L-0 v. 27 W-10 v. 24 W-10 v. 26 L-2 v. 29 L-0 v. 14 22 
 12 Ray Freeman L-0 v. 28 W-10 v. 25 W-10 v. 27 W-8 v. 3 L-0 v. 2 28 
 13 Scott Beall L-0 v. 29 L-0 v. 26 L-0 v. 31   0 
 14 Bruce Reiff W-10 v. 30 L-0 v. 1 W-10 v. 10 L-2 v. 8 W-10 v. 11 32 
 15 Chuck Stapp L-0 v. 1 W-8 v. 30 L-0 v. 3 L-0 v. 25  8 
 16 John Elliott T-5 v. 2 W-8 v. 19 W-10 v. 5 L-0 v. 1 L-0 v. 9 23 
 17 Tim Hitchings W-10 v. 18     10 
 18 Greg Smith L-0 v. 17 L-0 v. 34    0 
 19 John Sharp L-2 v. 3 L-2 v. 16 W-10 v. 30 L-0 v. 9 L-0 v. 35 14 
 20 Ben Gardner W-10 v. 4 W-10 v. 5 W-8 v. 1 W-10 v. 7 W-10 v. 28 48 
 
 21 Glenn Petroski L-0 v. 5 L-0 v. 4 L-0 v. 25 L-0 v. 35 L-0 v. 37 0 
 22 Sean Druelinger W-10 v.6 L-0 v. 7    10 
 23 Michel Boucher L-0 v. 7     0 
 24 Rob Hammond L-0 v. 8 L-0 v. 11  L-0 v. 36  0 
 25 Alan Zasada L-0 v. 9 L-0 v. 12 W-10 v. 21 W-10 v. 15 L-0 v. 3 20 
 26 Greg Hultgren L-0 v. 10 W-10 v. 13 L-0 v. 11 Bye-10  20 
 27 Bob Hamel W-10 v. 11 L-0 v. 8 L-0 v. 12 W-10 v. 4 L-2 v. 5 22 
 28 David Rynkowski W-10 v. 12 W-8 v. 9 Bye-10 W-8 v. 2 L-0 v. 20 36 
 29 Joe Powell W-10 v. 13 W-10 v. 10 L-0 v. 7 W-8 v. 11 W-8 v. 8 36 
 30 John Welage L-0 v. 14 L-2 v. 15 L-0 v. 19   2 
 
 31 Randy Schilb  L-0 v.33 W-10 v. 13 L-0 v. 5  10 
 32 Daniel Blumentritt  W-10 v. 31    10 
 33 Bruno Sinigaglio  W-10 v. 18    10 
 34 Ed Menzel   W-10 v. 8   4 
 35 Pat Richardson    W-10 v. 21 W-10 v. 19 20 
 36 Ed O’Connor    W-10 v. 24  10 
 37 Glenn McMaster     W-10 v. 21 10 
 38 Mike Kaye     W-10 v. 39 10 
 39 John Vogel     L-0 v. 38 0 
 
No. Name Quarterfinals Semifinals Final 
 
 1 Ben Gardner W v. 8 L v. 3 
 2 Rob Drozd L v. 7  
 3 Andy Choptiany W v. 6 W v. 1 W v. 7 
 4 David Rynkowski L v. 5 
 5 Joe Powell W v. 4 L v. 7 
 6 Jonathan Lockwood L v. 3 
 7 Bruce Monnin W v. 2 W v. 5 L v. 3 
 8 Bruce Reiff L v. 1  
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