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Bruce Monnin Wins 4th WBC War At Sea Crown 
Dennis Nicholson Inducted Into WAS Hall of Fame 

 
Bruce Monnin of Minster, OH lived up to his standing as a charter member of the War At Sea Hall of 

Fame by claiming his 4th WBC/Avaloncon championship; no one else has more.  Bruce finished 6-1-1 and 
hardly had an easy path to the championship, besting Jonathan Lockwood (Reston, VA, 6-2-0) in the final.  
The Gardners of Fairfax, VA, dad Andy (5-1-0) and son Ben (5-2-0) placed 3rd and 4th, respectively.  Andy 
was the only player to go undefeated in the Swiss rounds.  Dennis Nicholson (Pawling, NY/4-2-0) finished in 
5th place and was awarded the coffee table book Battle for the North Atlantic, given to the highest finisher who 
did not win a plaque.  The other playoff contenders were 6th, the GM (Wilmington, DE/4-2-0), 7th, Darren 
Kilfara (Dunbar, East Lothian, UK, 3-3-0) and 8th, Bob Hamel (Newington, CT/3-3-0).  Rounding out the top 
10 were defending WBC champ Andy Choptiany of Philadelphia, PA in 9th and Alan Zasada of Lemont, IL in 
10th, both at 3-2-0. 
 
 In a brief ceremony prior to the start of the tournament, Dennis Nicholson became the 6th member of the 
War At Sea Hall of Fame, joining previous inductees Alan Applebaum, Ray Freeman, Andy Gardner, 
Jonathan Lockwood, and Bruce Monnin.  Dennis is one of only 2 players to have won the War At Sea “Triple 
Crown”: the WBC, the PBEM Ladder Tournament, and the BPA PBEM Championship, among his other 
achievements.  And while it has no particular bearing on his War At Sea Hall of Fame status, it is perhaps most 
impressive that War At Sea is just one of the 9 different WBC events Dennis has won!  Induction into the Hall 
of Fame is no guarantee of success in future tournaments, but Dennis didn’t miss a beat this year, making the 
playoffs with a 3rd-best Swiss round finish. 
 
 26 players opened the competition shortly after 9 AM on tournament day, and another 10 entered in later 
rounds.  As is customary, eligibility for the majority of the playoff spots came down to Round 5, 8 hours later.  
At the start of Round 5, only Andy Gardner had clinched, with a 4-0-0 record, and opted sit out the round.  13 
other players competed for the remaining 7 playoff berths.  Ben Gardner and defending champ Andy 
Choptiany (both 3-1-0 and 30 VPs to that point) squared off on the first board, with Ben’s Axis prevailing 
against Andy’s Allies (bidding 2.5).  With the victory, Ben clinched his playoff berth.  Dennis Nicholson’s 
Axis defeated Darren Kilfara’s Allies (bidding 2.0) — both were 3-1-0 with 30 VPs — which earned Dennis a  
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2014 Tournament Recap (continued) 
 
playoff nod.  The GM’s (3-1-0, 28 VPs) Allies, bidding 1.5, sank Bob Hamel’s (3-1-0, 30 VPs) Axis to put the 
former into the playoffs. Jonathan Lockwood (3-1-0, 28 VPs) took the Allies for 2.5 POC and earned a first 
turn concession from Steve Packwood (2-2-0, 22 VPs) to secure a single-elimination slot.  On the next board, 
Bruce Monnin (2-1-1, 25 VPs) bid 2.0 for the Allies and proceeded to max out against Charlie Drozd’s (2-2-
0, 20 VPs) Axis, earning Bruce a playoff nod.  Alan Zasada and Devin Dausin faced off with identical 2-2-0 
and 20 VPs records, with the chance that the winner could qualify for a playoff spot.  Alan’s Allies, bidding 1.5, 
maxed out against Devin’s Axis.  Finally, Jim Kramer (2-2-0, 20 VPs) could have entered the playoff mix by 
beating David Rynkowski (who had already been eliminated), but David’s Axis prevailed instead, not needing 
the Allied bid of 1.5. 
 

At the conclusion of the Swiss round games, the top 6 finishers automatically qualified: 1) Andy 
Gardner, 40 Victory Points/4-0-0, 2) Ben Gardner, 40 VPs, 4-1-0, 3) Dennis Nicholson, 40 VPs & 4-1-0, 4) 
Jonathan Lockwood, 4-1-0, 38 VPs, 5) Vince Meconi, 36 VPs, 4-1-0, and 6) Bruce Monnin, 35 VPs and 3-1-
1.  A strength of schedule tiebreaker was needed for the final 2 playoff slots, with Darren Kilfara and Bob 
Hamel edging past Andy Choptiany and Alan Zasada.  Bob’s 6.7000 strength of schedule nosed out Andy’s 
6.6956 by the narrowest margin on record.  All 4 finished with 3-2-0 marks and 30 VPs.  Jonathan made the 
playoffs for a record 7th year in a row.  Ben and Bruce were the only 2 other playoff repeaters. 
 

In the quarterfinals, the Allies won all 4 games.  Top seed Andy Gardner edged #8 Bob Hamel, #2 
Ben Gardner bested #7 Darren Kilfara, #6 Bruce Monnin upset #3 Dennis Nicholson, and #4 Jonathan 
Lockwood easily handled the #5 GM.  The latter game was notable for the fact that when the Axis conceded, 
they still had every German ship afloat and undamaged.  The Gardner-Hamel match featured a bid of 2.0 for the 
Allies, and the other 3 games saw bids of 2.5.  In the semifinals, Jonathan Lockwood’s Allies, bidding 2.5, 
never lost the blockade in cruising past Ben Gardner’s Axis.  On the other board, Bruce Monnin’s Axis 
topped Andy Gardner’s Allies, who bid 2. 
 
 For the 2nd year in a row, the final game was a rematch: this year, Jonathan Lockwood vs. Bruce 
Monnin.  Jonathan had already bested Bruce in the Swiss rounds.  Bruce was reprising his appearance in the 
finals from last year.  Jonathan took a 6-0 record as the Allies into the final and got the Allies for a bid of 2.5.  
The game was not close, however, as Jonathan’s Allies, after failing multiple speed rolls and already in a 
hopeless position, resigned on turn 3.  Congratulations again to 2014 champion Bruce Monnin! 
 

This year’s field was comprised of 36 players who played 64 total games. Best Axis player was Andy 
Gardner at 2-0-0 while Jonathan Lockwood claimed Best Allied Player honors at 6-1-0 — the 5th time in the 
last 7 years he has been so recognized.  Rookie of the Year was Devin Dausin, who was taught the game right 
before Round 1 by fellow competitor Richard Beyma.  Devin finished 14th, which is also the highest finish 
ever by a female player.  
 

 Finally, Jim Kramer was our sportsmanship nominee.  In addition to being one of those players who’s 
always a pleasure to sit across from, when he faced a brand new player, he made the game a teaching 
experience, even though it ended up jeopardizing his own playoff chances. 
 

[Continued under 2014 Tournament Recap on page 3.] 
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2014 Tournament Recap (continued) 
 

I anticipate no format changes for next year.  However, I think adding a demo would improve 
attendance.  Unfortunately I do not have time to do it myself.  If this interests you, please let me know.  It’s also 
the 25th world championship next year, which calls for something special, I think — although I haven’t quite 
figured out what.  I look forward to seeing you all next year! 

 
Strategy, Play Balance, and Bidding 
 Our tournament players did not change their collective Allied strategy much this year.  The 
overwhelmingly favored opening was Barents on 1.  Again,  Axis players seem to be increasingly disinclined to 
fight early in the game unless the Allies fail multiple speed rolls. 
 
 Play balance continues to yo-yo.  This year’s WBC had 26 Axis wins (40.6%), 37 Allied wins (57.8%), 
and a tie (1.6%).  The recently concluded BPA PBEM Championship (congratulations to Rob Drozd), in 
contrast, had a 55% Axis win rate to only 40% for the Allies.  59 of this year’s WBC contests had an Allied bid 
with just 5 games featuring no bid.  The average bid this year was 1.73 (all games) and 1.88 (games with a bid).  
Both averages were the highest on record.  Here is a breakdown of wins and losses by bid. 
 
Bid Games Axis Win Allied Win Tie Allied Win % 
No Bid/Allied Bid 0 5 3 2 0 } 
Allies 0.5 1 0 1 0 } 42.9% 
Allies 1.0 2 1 1 0 } 
Allies 1.5 21 7 14 0 67.0% 
Allies 2.0 19 7 11 1 60.5% 
Allies 2.5 16 8 8 0 50.0% 
Totals 64 26 37 1 58.6% 
 
 Setting aside the low bid/no bid games, which were too few in number to comprise a representative 
sample, the Allied win margin decreased with each bid increment.  When used, bids obviously did their job. 
 
 Bidding influenced the outcome directly in 11 of our 64 games (17.2%).  One Allied win became a tie, 
one tie became an Axis win, and 3 Allied wins converted to Axis wins.  On top of those numbers, 5 Allied wins 
by 2 POC or more became Allies victories by less than 2 POC, and one Axis win by less than 2 POC converted 
to an Axis win by 2 POC or more. 
 
Book Review: Do You Want Total War? 
 I don’t usually do book reviews in a tournament newsletter, but on the other hand, not too many books I 
read are written by WBC War At Sea competitors.  Darren Kilfara not only is an expert War At Sea player (7th 
place this year), he has written an excellent novel, Do You Want Total War?  After I got over the 
disappointment of finding out that the book features the game Totaler Krieg rather than War At Sea, I 
thoroughly enjoyed it.  Anyone interested in boardgaming or military history is likely to find the book 
fascinating.  I thought I knew a lot about the history of European and other conflicts until I read this work. The 
wealth of knowledge contained within these 300 pages is astonishing.  As a gamer, you will relate totally to the 
protagonist, and today's gaming milieu is rendered to perfection.  On top of the subject matter, you will find an 
extremely well written book that also captures those often enjoyable but also often awkward high school years.  
It's very difficult for an adult to write in what is truly a teenager's voice, in my opinion, but Darren has done it. 
 
  



—4— 
 

2014 World Boardgaming Championships Final Standings 
 
    Axis Allies Total Swiss Schedule 
No. Name Played W-L-T W-L-T W-L-T Points  Strength Finish 
 
 2 Bruce Monnin 8 3-1-1 3-0-0 6-1-1 35 — 1 
 3 Jonathan Lockwood 8 0-1-0 6-1-0 6-2-0 38 — 2 
 4 Andy Gardner 6 2-0-0 3-1-0 5-1-0 40 5.75 3 
 10 Ben Gardner 7 2-1-0 3-1-0 5-2-0 40 5.24 4 
 12 Dennis Nicholson 6 3-2-0 1-0-0 4-2-0 40 5.00 5 
 14 Vince Meconi 6 0-2-0 4-0-0 4-2-0 36 — 6 
 6 Darren Kilfara 6 0-1-0 3-2-0 3-3-0 30 7.00 7 
 23 Bob Hamel 6 3-3-0 — 3-3-0 30 6.70 8 
 1 Andy Choptiany 5 — 3-2-0 3-2-0 30 6.70 9 
 19 Alan Zasada 5 0-1-0 3-1-0 3-2-0 30 4.09 10 
 
 8 Steve Packwood 5 0-2-0 2-1-0 2-3-0 22 — 11 
 7 Jim Kramer 5 1-0-0 1-3-0 2-3-0 20 6.00 12 
 9 John Pack 4 1-1-0 1-1-0 2-2-0 20 5.30 13 
 20 Devin Dausin 5 2-3-0 — 2-3-0 20 5.29 14 
 18 David Rynkowski 5 2-3-0 — 2-3-0 20 5.08 15 
 5 Charlie Drozd 5 2-1-0 0-2-0 2-3-0 20 4.64 16 
 11 Rob Drozd 4 1-0-0 0-2-1 1-2-1 17 — 17 
 22 John Sharp 5 1-3-0 1-0-0 2-3-0 16 — 18 
 31 Scott Sirianna 2 1-1-0 — 1-1-0 10 6.67 19 
 24 Andrew Doughan 4 1-2-0 0-1-0 1-3-0 10 5.44 20 
 
 13 Joe Collinson 2 1-1-0 — 1-1-0 10 5.00 21 
 27 Randy MacInnis 3 0-1-0 1-1-0 1-2-0 10 4.40 22 
 21 Steve Worrel 2 0-1-0 1-0-0 1-1-0 10 3.14 23 
 33 Ed Menzel 1 — 1-0-0 1-0-0 10 0.00 24 
 16 Sean Druelinger 1 0-1-0 — 0-1-0 2 7.20 25 
 35 Pat Richardson 1 — 0-1-0 0-1-0 2 3.20 26 
 29 Greg Smith 1 0-1-0 — 0-1-0 2 3.20 27 
 34 Tim Hitchings 1 0-1-0 — 0-1-0 0 10.00 28 
 17 Richard Beyma 1 0-1-0 — 0-1-0 0 10.00 29 
 28 Bryan Eshleman 1 0-1-0 — 0-1-0 0 7.20 30 
 
 25 John Welage 2 0-1-0 0-1-0 0-2-0 0 7.14 31 
 32 Chuck Stapp 1 — 0-1-0 0-1-0 0 6.00 32 
 30 John Elliott 1 — 0-1-0 0-1-0 0 5.00 33 
 15 Joe Powell 2 — 0-2-0 0-2-0 0 5.00 34 
 26 Ken Nied 1 — 0-1-0 0-1-0 0 5.00 35 
 36 Ed OConnor 0 — — — 0 — 36 
 
 36 Totals 64 26-37-1 37-26-1 63-63-2 570 
 
Key 
No. — Player seeding. 
Played — Number of games played by player, including quarterfinals, semifinals, and final. 
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2014 World Boardgaming Championships Final Standings (continued) 

 
Key (continued) 
W-L-T — Won-Lost-Tied 
Swiss Points — Number of VPs scored in 5 preliminary (Swiss) rounds. 
Schedule Strength — Used to break ties among players with same VPs; equals # of VPs earned by 
player’s opponents  
   divided by # of games played by player’s opponents. 
Finish — Final ranking.  Top 8 players are ranked by results of playoffs. 
 

War At Sea AREA Ratings/Preliminary 2015 WBC Seedings (as of November 2, 2014) 
 

 1 Bruce Monnin (Defending Champion) 6135 21 Charlie Drozd 5701 
 2 Andy Choptiany 6488 22 Karl Bodenheimer 5646 
 3 Andy Gardner 6318 23 Ted Drozd 5642 
 4 Pat Richardson 6257 24 Alan Applebaum 5621 
 5 Rob Flowers 6215 25 Andy Maly 5614 
 6 Jonathan Lockwood 6148 26 Ron Jacobsen 5609 
 7 Mike Kaye 6137 27 Rob Drozd 5569 
 8 Glenn McMaster 6047 28 Bruce Reiff 5550 
 9 Dennis Nicholson 5940 29 Ron Dietz 5532-i 
 10 Ben Gardner 5909 30 John Pack 5523 
 
 11 Nick Markevich 5878 31 John Strand 5515 
 12 Don Greenwood 5852 32 Joe Collinson 5500 
 13 Jim Kramer 5850 33 Kevin Shewfelt 5491 
 14 Tim Tow 5830 34 Jim Laws 5483 
 15 Steve Packwood  5796 35 David Lindsay 5471 
 16 Vince Meconi 5794 36 Mike Knautz 5470 
 17 Darren Kilfara 5784 37 David Finberg 5440-i 
 18 Ed Menzel 5739 38 Steve Carver 5434-i 
 19 Mike Pacheco 5724 39 Phil Rennert 5425 
 20 Ray Freeman 5702 40 Bob Hamel 5405 
 
i=Inactive AREA status. 
Italicized players have not previously entered a WBC/Avaloncon War At Sea tournament. 
 
Many Thanks 
 As always, putting on the War At Sea tournament is a team effort, starting with Assistant Gamemasters 
Rob Drozd and John Sharp.  Charlie Drozd, Bob Hamel, and Bruce Monnin helped out in numerous other 
ways.  My Swiss round opponents, Andy Choptiany, Bryan Eshleman, Bob Hamel, Steve Packwood, and 
John Sharp, gentlemen all, played quickly and complained about the dice a lot less than I did.  They also set up 
the game afterwards, allowing me to concentrate on my GM duties.  Thanks to Tim Hitchings, Ed Menzel, 
Greg Smith, and John Welage, who each volunteered, at various times, to be the “odd man in or out” if we had 
an odd number of players.  As a result, nobody got a bye all day long.  And finally, thanks to Ed Menzel for 
providing me with AREA Ratings both pre- and post-tournament. 
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Tournament Notes and Statistics 
 After winning the Victory in the Pacific event earlier in the week, Andy Gardner became the latest to 
try to win the championships of both our sister game and War At Sea at the same WBC.  He came up short, but 
his 3rd place finish in War At Sea got him as close as anyone yet…Devin Dausin, Bob Hamel, and David 
Rynkowski played every game as the Axis, while Andy Choptiany commanded Allied forces each time out 
….Your GM managed the dubious distinction of winning every time he played the Allies but losing each game 
as the Axis….Welcome back returnees Richard Beyma, Andrew Doughan, Bryan Eshleman, Darren 
Kilfara, Randy MacInnis, Dennis Nicholson, Ken Nied, Scott Sirianna, and Steve Worrel…Most of our 
returnees rejoined us after only a year or two absence, but Scott and Steve last appeared in 2004….Participation 
in the annual Family War At Sea event has dwindled to just two contestants, with the Gardners, son Ben and 
dad Andy, besting the father-son Drozd tandem of Rob and Charlie….David Rynkowski played the day’s 
toughest schedule by far with opponents seeded numbers 1, 2, 5, 7, and 8….Personal best finishes were 
recorded by Alan Zasada (10) and Andrew Doughan (20) ….Current active tournament appearance streaks 
include Tim Hitchings, 24 years and the only player to have played at least one game in every one of the War 
At Sea tournaments at Avaloncon and the WBC, Jonathan Lockwood and Steve Packwood, 20 years, Andy 
Gardner and Jim Kramer, 18 years, Ed Menzel, 15 years, the GM, David Rynkowski, and John Welage, 13 
consecutive years, and Charlie Drozd, Rob Drozd, John Sharp, and Chuck Stapp (12 straight years, since 
2001). 
 
 24 years of War At Sea tournaments have included 8 Avaloncons, 16 WBCs, 53 PBEM Ladder Rounds, 
and 10 BPA PBEM Championships....Of the 3,574 games played so far, the Allies have won 1,798 (51.2%) to 
the Axis’ 1,624 (46.3%), with 87 ties (2.5%) and 65 in which either no side was chosen or we are missing the 
information....There have been 2,157 contests with an Allied bid (63.7%) and 157 featuring Axis bids (4.6%); 
there was no bid in 1,072 games (31.7%) and we lack details for 188 games....However, every tournament 
contested in the last 8 years has had at least 75% bids for the Allies….For the 1st time in many years, David 
Finberg does not have the best career tournament War At Sea winning percentage.  Ted Drozd has supplanted 
him with a .727 mark; David sits in 2nd with .714, followed by 3) Rob Flowers (.697), 4) Tom Scarborough 
(.692), and 5) Glenn McMaster (.680)....The 5 top Axis records are held by 1) David Finberg (.818), 2) Glenn 
McMaster (.728), 3) Rob Flowers (.714), 4) Jim Kramer (.690), and 5) Tim Tow (.688)....Phil Rennert 
(.725) tops the Allied charts, followed by 2) Mike Kaye (.721), 3) Bruce Reiff (.721), 4) Steve Packwood 
(.716), and 5) John Elliott (.714)....Ewan McNay and Glenn McMaster share the best record in 
WBC/Avaloncon games at .735, Scott Beall has the best PBEM Ladder winning percentage at .800, and Ed 
Menzel the top balance sheet in BPA PBEM Championship contests (.750)....This year’s finalists Jonathan 
Lockwood and Bruce Monnin have most of the “Mosts”: Jonathan has played the most tournament games, 
229, and has the most total wins (153), Allied wins (122), and playoff appearances (11); Bruce has the most 
Axis wins (69) and WBC/Avaloncon wins (79). 
 
War At Sea E-Mail Tournaments 
 The War At Sea Ladder Tournament is currently on Round 55.  Greg Smith is in charge of the tourney, 
and complete details on the tourney can be found at http://waratsea.wordpress.com/round-55/.  New players are 
always welcome in this highly competitive event.  Rob Flowers currently occupies the top ladder rung. 
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2014 World Boardgaming Championships Final Game-by-Game Results 

 
No. Name Round 1 Round 2 Round 3 Round 4 Round 5 VPs 
 
   Players: 26 Players: 28 Players: 22 Players: 22 Players: 16 
   Games: 13 Games: 14 Games: 11 Games: 11 Games: 8 
 
 1 Andy Choptiany W-10 v. 14 L-0 v. 9 W-10 v. 18 W-10 v. 3 L-0 v. 10 30 
 2 Bruce Monnin W-10 v. 15 T-5 v. 11 L-0 v. 3 W-10 v. 18 W-10 v. 5 35 
 3 Jonathan Lockwood W-8 v. 16 W-10 v. 23 W-10 v. 2 L-0 v. 1 W-10 v. 8 38 
 4 Andy Gardner W-10 v. 17 W-10 v. 12 W-10 v. 8 W-10 v. 6  40 
 5 Charlie Drozd L-0 v. 18 L-0 v. 20 W-10 v. 27 W-10 v. 11 L-0 v. 2 20 
 6 Darren Kilfara W-10 v. 19 W-10 v. 13 W-10 v. 9 L-0 v. 4 L-0 v. 12 30 
 7 Jim Kramer W-8 v. 20 L-2 v. 10 W-10 v. 19 L-0 v. 12 L-0 v. 18 20 
 8 Steve Packwood W-10 v. 21 W-10 v. 18 L-0 v. 4 L-2 v. 14 L-0 v. 3 22 
 9 John Pack W-10 v. 22 W-10 v. 1 L-0 v. 6 L-0 v. 23  20 
 10 Ben Gardner L-2 v. 23 W-8 v. 7 W-10 v. 31 W-10 v. 20 W-10 v. 1 40 
 
 11 Rob Drozd W-10 v. 24 T-5 v. 2 L-2 v. 20 L-0 v. 5  17 
 12 Dennis Nicholson W-10 v. 25 L-0 v. 4 W-10 v. 24 W-10 v. 7 W-10 v. 6 40 
 13 Joe Collinson W-10 v. 26 L-0 v. 6    10 
 14 Vince Meconi L-0 v. 1 W-10 v. 28 W-10 v. 22 W-8 v. 8 W-8 v. 23 36 
 15 Joe Powell L-0 v. 2 L-0 v. 24    0 
 16 Sean Druelinger L-2 v. 3     2 
 17 Richard Beyma L-0 v. 4     0 
 18 David Rynkowski W-10 v. 5 L-0 v. 8 L-0 v. 1 L-0 v. 2 W-10 v. 7 20 
 19 Alan Zasada L-0 v. 6 W-10 v. 27 L-0 v. 7 W-10 v. 24 W-10 v. 20 30 
 20 Devin Dausin L-2 v. 7 W-10 v. 5 W-8 v. 11 L-0 v. 10 L-0 v. 19 20 
 
 21 Steve Worrel L-0 v. 8 W-10 v. 25    10 
 22 John Sharp L-0 v. 9 W-8 v. 29 L-0 v. 14 L-0 v. 27 W-8 v. 35 16 
 23 Bob Hamel W-8 v. 10 L-0 v. 3 W-10 v. 32 W-10 v. 9 L-2 v. 14 30 
 24 Andrew Doughan L-0 v. 11 W-10 v. 15 L-0 v. 12 L-0 v. 19  10 
 25 John Welage L-0 v. 12 L-0 v. 21    0 
 26 Ken Nied L-0 v. 13     0 
 27 Randy MacInnis  L-0 v. 19 L-0 v. 5 W-10 v. 22  10 
 28 Bryan Eshleman  L-0 v. 14    0 
 29 Greg Smith  L-2 v. 22    2 
 30 John Elliott  L-0 v. 31    0 
 
 31 Scott Sirianna  W-10 v 30 L-0 v. 10   10 
 32 Chuck Stapp   L-0 v. 23   0 
 33 Ed Menzel    W-10 v. 34  10 
 34 Tim Hitchings    L-0 v. 33  0 
 35 Pat Richardson     L-2 v. 22 2 
 36 Ed O’Connor      0 
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2014 World Boardgaming Championships Final Game-by-Game Results (continued) 

 
No. Name Quarterfinals Semifinals Final 
 
 1 Andy Gardner W v. 8 L v. 4 
 2 Ben Gardner W v. 7 L v. 6 
 3 Dennis Nicholson L v. 6 
 4 Jonathan Lockwood W v. 5 W v. 1 L v. 6 
 5 Vince Meconi L v. 4 
 6 Bruce Monnin W v. 3 W v. 2 W v. 4 
 7 Darren Kilfara L v. 2 
 8 Bob Hamel L v. 1 
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